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the case for effective communication They say that one
picture is worth a thousand words. In the realm of

health information exchange (HIE), the word picture is
the patient. Although technically there is little

difference between a patient and a patient record, the
term “patient” is so commonly used in health care

today that it has become shorthand for the term patient
record. Effective health information exchange begins

with a good communication strategy. In this article, I’ll
provide a few pointers about creating an effective

communication strategy. You’ll be learning about: What
is patient-centered communication? The 7 goals of
patient-centered communication What is the role of

information technology (IT) in patient-centered
communication? What are the success factors of patient-

centered communication? Before you read this article,
let’s first take a look at what patient-centered

communication is, why it is important, and the 7 goals
of patient-centered communication. What Is Patient-

Centered Communication? Patient-centered
communication is the practice of communication that
puts the patient’s needs and goals first, keeping her

informed about what is going on, what matters to her,
and what options are available. It requires paying

attention to her emotional and physical needs and the
best ways to meet those needs. When I think about
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patient-centered communication, I think of 2 key
aspects – the patient’s needs and goals and the best

ways to meet those needs. These 2 aspects of patient-
centered communication are represented in the

diagram below. I can’t find a hard-and-fast definition of
patient-centered communication, but some of the other
definitions that I have found include: e-Privacy [Act of
Parliament] (General Data Protection Regulation) (EU)

2016/679 general data protection regulation | | In-
language education and training In-language education

and training “The patient-centered care movement
recognizes the power of language, and that it is a
shared responsibility of healthcare professionals,

patients, and 6d1f23a050
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